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Is smoking, alcohol, drugs, food, gambling, the Internet, or sex addiction holding you back from getting what
you want most—in work and in love? We’re all addicted to something—but when the crutch gets in the way
of living a happy and productive life, it must stop. Over the past twenty-five years, renowned addiction
therapist Dr. Frederick Woolverton has used his dynamic, empathetic approach to help thousands of addicts
achieve long-term recovery—including himself. He sees the specific habit as less important than the
underlying chaos and fear that motivate the urge to sooth ourselves with bad habits. The solution, he has
found, requires only a better understanding of yourself and a change in attitude. Unhooked: How To Quit
Anything is an intelligent, readable, and actionable guide to conquering any addictive habit. Using real
patient examples as well as research and his own experience, Dr. Woolverton and coauthor (and former
patient) Susan Shapiro show how to thrive without self-medicating. The approach involves an unorthodox
blend of straightforward changes to behavior and open and honest conversation with another person.
Woolverton’s specific instructions do not require an expensive therapist, rehab, 12-step program, or a higher
power (but he does make readers aware of those viable options). Let him help you kick your addiction and
find what’s missing in your world. When you conquer a toxic habit, you are leaving room for something
more beautiful to take its place.
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From reader reviews:

Mora Miller:

The knowledge that you get from Unhooked: How to Quit Anything is a more deep you looking the
information that hide inside the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that
this book is hard to recognise but Unhooked: How to Quit Anything giving you excitement feeling of
reading. The article author conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood simply by anyone
who read the idea because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This book also makes your current
vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We recommend you for having this Unhooked: How to Quit Anything instantly.

Rosalva Nichols:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just
watching TV, or playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look
different you can read some sort of book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you
simply read you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a reserve. The book Unhooked: How to Quit Anything it
is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading
this book. When you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can
m0ore simply to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book has high
quality.

Tammy Schuler:

This Unhooked: How to Quit Anything is great reserve for you because the content which can be full of
information for you who else always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This book
reveal it details accurately using great coordinate word or we can declare no rambling sentences within it. So
if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight
forward sentences but tricky core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Unhooked: How
to Quit Anything in your hand like getting the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous just one. We
can say that no e-book that offer you world within ten or fifteen small right but this guide already do that. So
, this really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt in which?

David Blackwood:

Is it a person who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Unhooked: How to Quit Anything can be the
response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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