
New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies and
Teachings for the New Times

Lori Adaile Toye

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=1880050455
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=1880050455
http://ijos.club/go/read.php?id=1880050455


New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies and Teachings for
the New Times

Lori Adaile Toye

New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies and Teachings for the New Times Lori Adaile Toye
New and Revised Edition of New World Atlas Volume One (2010) contains over 60 Earth Change Maps, a
Glossary of Terms, and an extensive index. Prior to a dream in 1983, Lori Adaile Toye was a farm wife and
the mother of three small children. Since she had been a student of Ascended Masters teachings from 1978,
when four beings in white robes appeared to her in a vision and unrolled huge maps of North America,
showing imminent changes on earth, she quickly recognized these Beings as the spiritual teachers she had
been studying. Five years later, Lori began to probe the vision through daily meditation, hoping that the
details about the prophecy would be revealed. The Ascended Masters appeared again and expressed
willingness to share the information. Six months and eighty session later the most detailed body of earth
changes prophecy that the Western world had received in recent times was revealed. Ten percent of this
material contained the I AM America Map of Earth Changes for the United States. The balance of the
remaining information contained spiritual teachings. This book is the first volume of those teachings.
Ascended Master Saint Germain presents prophecies for a new time and practical solutions that can heal and
transform our lives. The teachings contained in this book state that cataclysmic and devastating earth
changes can be lessened or averted through a change in humanity's heart and mind.
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From reader reviews:

Marvin Murphy:

Here thing why that New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies and Teachings for the New Times are
different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all examining a book is good but it really depends in the
content from it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies
and Teachings for the New Times giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any
publication out there but there is no publication that similar with New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies
and Teachings for the New Times. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own personal eyes
about the thing which happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. It is easy to bring
everywhere like in park, café, or even in your means home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing
the printed book maybe the form of New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies and Teachings for the New
Times in e-book can be your alternate.

Jack Godina:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity have you
got when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try
this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the book you have read is
definitely New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies and Teachings for the New Times.

Dwight Hancock:

You can obtain this New World Atlas, Volume One: Prophecies and Teachings for the New Times by
browse the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve problem if you get
difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only simply by written or printed but can
you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking from your mobile
phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your
publication. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to
choose suitable ways for you.

Ron Taylor:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person just like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to know that reading
is very important and also book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by book.
Amount types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims New World Atlas,



Volume One: Prophecies and Teachings for the New Times.
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