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SAILOR MAN is an examination of the combat service of James Preston Nunnally, an underage enlistee
aboard the USS Fuller in the Pacific Theater during WWII. Popularly known as the "Queen of Attack
Transports," the Fuller received a wartime high nine battle stars for participation in that number of invasions.
Nunnally was a crew member for seven of those  actions (Bougainville, Saipan, Tinian, Peleliu, the
Philipinnes-twice, and Okinawa). It is primarily based on letters Nunnally wrote to his son four decades after
the events occurred in an attempt to explain why he had abandoned his son and digressed into a life of
alcoholism. In addition to Nunnally's letters, other documents are used, such as a semi-official accounts of
the Fuller's actions written in 1945, and interviews with Nunnally's son and sister.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Deemer:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what you problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you don't have spare
time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time? What did you do?
Every person has many questions above. They have to answer that question mainly because just their can do
that. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on pre-
school until university need this particular Sailor Man: The Troubled Life and Times of J.P. Nunnally, U.S.
Navy to read.

Raymond Blalock:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the title Sailor Man: The
Troubled Life and Times of J.P. Nunnally, U.S. Navy suitable to you? Typically the book was written by
well-known writer in this era. The particular book untitled Sailor Man: The Troubled Life and Times of J.P.
Nunnally, U.S. Navyis one of several books this everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many
people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know prior
to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to recognise the core
of this book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world in this book.

Karena Figueroa:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or maybe playing
video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read the book.
It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day every day to reading a
e-book. The book Sailor Man: The Troubled Life and Times of J.P. Nunnally, U.S. Navy it is rather good to
read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In
case you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore
simply to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book features high quality.

Robert Russo:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with
family or just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a
book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere?
It alright you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Sailor Man: The
Troubled Life and Times of J.P. Nunnally, U.S. Navy which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this
book? Let's notice.
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