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Marcus Tempus is a writer based in Chicago and he had written a book about Chocolate and how some
women preferred it to Sex called "Do not get between a Woman and her Chocolate" In doing the research for
the book he had met Anastasia and they had agreed to go on a "Journey of Joy" and maybe fall in love. The
book covers their travel experiences to Greece, Paris, London, Ireland, Marrakech and Malaysia. The travel
writing is believed to be accurate and the places mentioned real. The fictional part of the book relates to the
relationship that develops between Marcus and Anastasia as they become closer during their travels. A
background theme is developed with Marcus who had recently fallen in love and it had changed his life. The
relationship had not developed as he would have liked so he had sought the help of some spiritual advisors,
and even consulted a Voodoo High Priestess, in order to understand why he had fallen in love so strongly
and why he remained emotionally lost in this world of unrequited love. The advisors had told him that in a
previous life, several hundred years ago, he had been a warrior named "Malin" and he had fallen in love with
"Alesia" and that they were "Soul Mates" destined to meet again. Most of the advisors had told him that
when he had fallen in love this was Malin and Alesia trying to connect in another life. The book explores the
difficulty Marcus is experiencing in trying to reconcile all of these emotional and spiritual feelings with his
no nonsense logical brain. He is left with the main questions, "Is Anastasia the latest visitation of Alesia and
is she the Soul Mate that he has been seeking all along"
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Sherman:

This 21 Days to Love: A Journey of Joy is great publication for you because the content and that is full of
information for you who all always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. That book reveal
it information accurately using great organize word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you
are read the item hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward
sentences but difficult core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having 21 Days to Love: A
Journey of Joy in your hand like having the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one
particular. We can say that no e-book that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but this e-book
already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt in which?

Fred Swett:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can
know everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This guide 21 Days to Love: A Journey of Joy was filled concerning
science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can feel enjoy
to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Melvin Bragg:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This specific book 21 Days to Love: A Journey of Joy was bright
colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book 21 Days to Love: A Journey of Joy has
many kinds or type. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can
read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book usually are make you bored,
any it offers you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading
in which.

Nancy Collins:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose
the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is called of
book 21 Days to Love: A Journey of Joy. You can include your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed
book, it could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most important that, you must
aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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