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The text of this Norton Critical Edition is based, with typesetting errors corrected, on the first U.S.
edition (1876), the most authoritative of the editions published in Twain’s lifetime.

“Backgrounds and Contexts” provides students with the standard source materials often cited by
critics?Twain’s stories of Good and Bad Boys, his Boy’s Manuscript, his correspondence with William Dean
Howells, and his 1870 letter to Will Bowen. This section also includes lesser-known but valuable contextual
materials, among them Twain’s journalistic description of school exercise and the discussion of Perry Davis’
Pain Killer and other nineteenth-century nostrums.

“Criticism” includes interpretations by William Dean Howells, Hamlin L. Hill, Judith Fetterley, Alan
Gribben, Glenn Hendler, Carter Revard, and Susan R. Gannon.

A Chronology and Selected Bibliography are also included.
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From reader reviews:

Lenore Ryan:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. That's
why, by reading a guide your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand than other is high. For
you who want to start reading any book, we give you this The Adventures of Tom Sawyer (Norton Critical
Editions) book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

William Kelley:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of book
you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want feel
happy read one having theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The The Adventures of Tom Sawyer
(Norton Critical Editions) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Thomas Gonzalez:

The particular book The Adventures of Tom Sawyer (Norton Critical Editions) has a lot details on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous
author. This articles author makes some research prior to write this book. That book very easy to read you
will get the point easily after reading this article book.

Randal Gore:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is composed or printed or created from each source which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or
just trying to find the The Adventures of Tom Sawyer (Norton Critical Editions) when you needed it?
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