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Bioterrorism is not a new threat, but in an increasingly interconnected world, the potential for catastrophic
outcomes is greater today than ever. The medical and public health communities are establishing
biosurveillance systems designed to proactively monitor populations for possible disease outbreaks as a first
line of defense. The ideal biosurveillance system should identify trends not visible to individual physicians
and clinicians in near-real time. Many of these systems use statistical algorithms to look for anomalies and to
trigger epidemiologic investigation, quantification, localization, and outbreak management. This book
discusses the design and evaluation of statistical methods for effective biosurveillance for readers with
minimal statistical training. Weaving public health and statistics together, it presents basic and more
advanced methods, with a focus on empirically demonstrating added value. Although the emphasis is on
epidemiologic and syndromic surveillance, the statistical methods can be applied to a broad class of public
health surveillance problems.
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From reader reviews:

James Marcus:

The event that you get from Introduction to Statistical Methods for Biosurveillance: With an Emphasis on
Syndromic Surveillance could be the more deep you digging the information that hide into the words the
more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Introduction to
Statistical Methods for Biosurveillance: With an Emphasis on Syndromic Surveillance giving you
excitement feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood simply by
anyone who read that because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This book also makes your
vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or
e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having that Introduction to Statistical Methods for
Biosurveillance: With an Emphasis on Syndromic Surveillance instantly.

James Lightle:

This book untitled Introduction to Statistical Methods for Biosurveillance: With an Emphasis on Syndromic
Surveillance to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book
you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail outlet or you can order
it by means of online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this
book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you personally to
past this publication from your list.

Clorinda Combs:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information easier to share. You
can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You will
observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended to
you is Introduction to Statistical Methods for Biosurveillance: With an Emphasis on Syndromic Surveillance
this guide consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This particular book was
represented just how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use to explain it is easy
to understand. The particular writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book
appropriate all of you.

Joe Williams:

Is it you who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Introduction to Statistical Methods for
Biosurveillance: With an Emphasis on Syndromic Surveillance can be the response, oh how comes? A book
you know. You are thus out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand new era is common not
a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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