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Few rescue missions have succeeded like “Operation Thunderbolt,” the Israeli plan led by Yoni Netanyahu
on July 4, 1976, to rescue 105 hijacked Jewish passengers held captive in Uganda’s Entebbe Airport. In her
gripping biography Speregen introduces young readers to one of Israel’s bravest soldiers. She paints a
dramatic portrait of the young man who came to embody Judaism’s highest values through his commitment
to Israel and the Jewish people. Includes black and white photographs and maps.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Powell:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with training books but if you want really
feel happy read one using theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the Yoni Netanyahu:
Commando at Entebbe (A JPS Young Biography Series) is kind of publication which is giving the reader
unstable experience.

Ron Lauer:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Yoni Netanyahu: Commando
at Entebbe (A JPS Young Biography Series), you could enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still
desire to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't obtain
it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Maribel Davenport:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is identified as of book
Yoni Netanyahu: Commando at Entebbe (A JPS Young Biography Series). You can include your knowledge
by it. Without leaving the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most
essential that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.

Pauline Bardwell:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also you know
that little person including reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning something by book.
Many kinds of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is actually Yoni Netanyahu:
Commando at Entebbe (A JPS Young Biography Series).
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