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This book consists of a series of essays which addresses the essentials of the development processes in user-
experience design (UX design) planning, research, analysis, evaluation, training and  implementation, and
deals with  the essential components (metaphors, mental models, navigation, and appearance) of user-
interfaces and user-experiences during the period of 2002-2007.

These essays grew from the authors own column entitled ‘Fast Forward’ which appeared in Interaction
Magazine – the flagship publication of the ACM Special Interest Group on Human-Computing Interaction
(SIGCHI). Written in such a way as to ensure longevity, these essays have not been edited or updated,
however a short Postscripts has been added to provide some comments on each topic from a current
perspective.

HCI and User-Experience Design provides a fascinating historical review of  the professional and research
world of UX and HCI during a period of significant growth and development and would be of interest to
students, researchers, and designers who are interested in recent developments within the field.
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From reader reviews:

Willene Choate:

The book HCI and User-Experience Design: Fast-Forward to the Past, Present, and Future (Human-
Computer Interaction Series) (English and Chinese Edition) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
can use to make your capable more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting strain or
having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book HCI and User-Experience Design:
Fast-Forward to the Past, Present, and Future (Human-Computer Interaction Series) (English and Chinese
Edition) to become your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own personal capable,
increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open and
read a guide HCI and User-Experience Design: Fast-Forward to the Past, Present, and Future (Human-
Computer Interaction Series) (English and Chinese Edition). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that,
science reserve or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this publication?

Christina Mundell:

Now a day folks who Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this HCI and User-Experience Design: Fast-Forward
to the Past, Present, and Future (Human-Computer Interaction Series) (English and Chinese Edition) book as
this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred pct guarantees
there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Catherine Benavidez:

HCI and User-Experience Design: Fast-Forward to the Past, Present, and Future (Human-Computer
Interaction Series) (English and Chinese Edition) can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that could increase your
knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The
article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing HCI and User-
Experience Design: Fast-Forward to the Past, Present, and Future (Human-Computer Interaction Series)
(English and Chinese Edition) however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest and
also based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can
certainly drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial imagining.

Delores Saenz:

Beside this particular HCI and User-Experience Design: Fast-Forward to the Past, Present, and Future
(Human-Computer Interaction Series) (English and Chinese Edition) in your phone, it could possibly give
you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you will got here



is fresh from the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow small town. It is
good thing to have HCI and User-Experience Design: Fast-Forward to the Past, Present, and Future (Human-
Computer Interaction Series) (English and Chinese Edition) because this book offers to your account
readable information. Do you at times have book but you do not get what it's about. Oh come on, that won't
happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, just like
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss this? Find this book along with read it from at this
point!
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