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“How about this, then? I'll tell you what I do when I leave,” he said.
“Then I hope I never find out...”

When Isabel Baker agreed to moonlight as a bartender at a private party, she never imagined she'd get
anything more than tips. However, on this resort island, nothing was ever that simple.

After tending bar with the deliciously handsome Noah who was flown in for the party, Izzy realized that she
was about to break her number one rule: never fall for a tourist. But with his quick wit, charming smile and
passion for marine life, Noah was the kind of guy that she couldn’t resist. At the end of the night, she barely
managed to turn him away from coming home with her.

Noah had only come to the island for one of Jack Saunders' famous parties. Yet once he met Izzy, he
couldn’t bring himself to leave. After one steamy night together, he knew that he would do almost anything
to keep her.

Theirs should have been an easy love story, complete with a happily ever after. Except Noah was also
moonlighting as a bartender that night and his true identity threatened Izzy’s research. When his billion-
dollar company and her marine research project collide, their entire relationship crumbles into the sand. Will
they be able to rebuild their beautiful sandcastle together, or will it be washed away by the rising tide,
forever just a memory?

“Did you know that my back porch has the best view on the island?” he asked quietly. I smiled. The man
knew how to change the subject.

“Is that so?”

“Best view on the island.” He crossed his arms with a smug smile.

“And you've been everywhere on the island to check this?”

Noah grinned, standing up and offering me his hand. I couldn't refuse the opportunity to touch him, so I took
it and followed him out onto the back porch. He only let me go so that he could close the door behind us.

I leaned up against the railing, looking up at the moon. Her silver light reflected down on the ocean waves,
turning their white tips bright. The sky was dark purple now, and the air was humid, dark, and full of
promise.

“Yup, definitely the best view on the island,” Noah whispered, making me turn. He wasn't looking at the
night sky or the ocean. He was looking at me. It was slightly cheesy, but I enjoyed the compliment.

Noah moved forward, gathering me up in his arms. The masculine scent of his light cologne was



exhilarating. His mouth slowly slanted to mine, sending small thrills up and down my spine. He went further,
tasting me with his tongue like I was something to be savored. A low moan escaped my lips as he pulled me
closer to him, his arms strong and demanding around me. His kiss was sweeter than heaven and hotter than
hell.

I didn't want to fall for another tourist. You're not falling, I told myself. You're simply enjoying. I knew he
was going to leave and I would be sad. But I would also be far more disappointed if I missed this. His kiss
was insistent, intoxicating, and driving me insane. I wanted to melt into him and let him melt into me. I
wanted to kiss every inch of his skin. Every inch.

I had never been so turned on by a kiss before. It was as if Noah knew everything I loved in a kiss and was
delivering and then some. I had never felt this sort of connection with another human being before. I didn't
want to get hurt, but I wasn't going to miss this either. Just one last tourist...
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Sherman:

The reason? Because this Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) is an
unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will distress you with
the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the
meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it.
This unique book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your
ability and your critical thinking means. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to
the guide store hurriedly.

Jose Longoria:

Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) can be one of your beginning books
that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the
information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing
Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) although doesn't forget the main
place, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource details that maybe you can be one among
it. This great information may drawn you into fresh stage of crucial considering.

Henry Taylor:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for you is Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) this
publication consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This particular book was
represented how do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer value to explain it is easy to
understand. Typically the writer made some study when he makes this book. This is why this book
appropriate all of you.

Warren Cruz:

A lot of reserve has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it.
It is referred to as of book Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4). You can
add your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you
actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one



location to other place.

Download and Read Online Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love
Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) Krista Lakes #GRWJP53K7CL



Read Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series
Book 4) by Krista Lakes for online ebook

Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) by Krista Lakes Free PDF
d0wnl0ad, audio books, books to read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books
online, book reviews epub, read books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF
best books to read, top books to read Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4)
by Krista Lakes books to read online.

Online Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) by Krista
Lakes ebook PDF download

Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) by Krista Lakes Doc

Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) by Krista Lakes Mobipocket

Sandcastle Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 4) by Krista Lakes EPub


