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It's not gay if it's another you, right?

That's what college twink Tanner has to ask himself, after a night of heavy partying with his three best
friends. When one of their hazing pranks gets a little too real, he decides to call it an early night. The last
thing he expected, was to wake up with an identical partner wrapped underneath his covers!

As he quickly finds out, dirty little secrets in a hectic frathouse never stay hidden for long. At first, it's fun to
experiment and touch his new clone's familiar body, but it's only a matter of time before he starts to wonder
what any man would. Tanner's other self shares his every thought, his innermost memories and kinkiest
fantasies... He knows just what buttons to push, and their mutual arrogance eventually devolves into an all-
out war to determine which of them is the original, and who is the perverted by-product of a bad night's
sleep.

With his nosy friends unravelling excuses at every turn, and a gay clone who persists in exposing his
sexuality, Tanner has to start thinking with his head instead of his... you know what. Will he be able to repair
the laws of nature before someone discovers what he's been keeping in his bedroom? Or will his
doppelgänger succeed in showing his frat brothers what the 'real' Tanner is like?
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From reader reviews:

Harold Cole:

Here thing why this kind of Help! My Gay Clone Thinks I'm A Pervert are different and reputable to be
yours. First of all reading a book is good but it depends in the content from it which is the content is as
delicious as food or not. Help! My Gay Clone Thinks I'm A Pervert giving you information deeper and in
different ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no publication that similar with Help! My Gay
Clone Thinks I'm A Pervert. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this
happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like
in area, café, or even in your approach home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the
printed book maybe the form of Help! My Gay Clone Thinks I'm A Pervert in e-book can be your choice.

Darrin Russell:

This Help! My Gay Clone Thinks I'm A Pervert usually are reliable for you who want to be a successful
person, why. The reason of this Help! My Gay Clone Thinks I'm A Pervert can be among the great books
you must have will be giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed anyone with information
that maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere
and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Help! My Gay Clone Thinks
I'm A Pervert giving you an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of
critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Joshua Matthews:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book especially book entitled Help!
My Gay Clone Thinks I'm A Pervert your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each
aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every single word written
in a publication then become one application form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get
ahead of. The Help! My Gay Clone Thinks I'm A Pervert giving you an additional experience more than
blown away the mind but also giving you useful info for your better life within this era. So now let us teach
you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished examining it,
like winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Henry Slaughter:

You may spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This Help! My Gay Clone Thinks I'm A
Pervert is simple to deliver you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not
include much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you quicker to
read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when you buy this book.
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